
The Ethiopian Journal of Education Vol. XXII No. 1 June 2002 

 

85 

Competency Beliefs, Teaching Confidence and Teaching 

Performances of English Major Graduating  

Students in Teaching Practice 

 
Abiy Yigzaw

*
 

 

Abstract: This study endeavored to explore the competency beliefs, 

teaching confidence in teaching practice, and teaching performances of 
graduating English major students at Bahir Dar University (BDU). Pre-and 
post-teaching practice explorations were made using questionnaires, 
interviews, and documents analyses. Pearson’s Correlation Co-efficient and 
descriptive methods were employed for analysis,. Findings indicated a 
strong correlation between the trainees’ competency beliefs in their linguistic 
capacity and knowledge of methods. Their competency beliefs, however, 
had no significant relations with their teaching confidence and teaching 
performance. The instructors reported the trainees had low level of 
competence. The trainees’ interview indicated that there was a mismatch 
between their expectations and the classroom realities. Finally, it was 
concluded that many of the trainees may have been equipped with 
theoretical knowledge, but they lacked adequate teaching practice and 
language command. Therefore, it was recommended that the trainees be 
offered additional skill courses to enhance their language capacity, more 
practice time be arranged, and methodology courses be designed to 
integrate awareness creating and practice. 
 

Introduction 
 

Language teacher education offers two kinds of structured 
professional education. The first is believed to equip trainees with the 
necessary intellectual content of linguistic skills. The other is 
assumed to enable the trainees to become professionally competent 
with necessary knowledge of teaching.  An inseparable concurrent or 
subsequent activity to the knowledge of teaching is teaching practice. 
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The degree courses in English offered at Bahir Dar University (BDU) 
are designed to develop the students’ linguistic capacity and their 
teaching skills. To enhance their linguistic capacity, the students are 
offered three speech (144 hrs.), four writing (192 hrs.) one listening 
(48 hrs.) and one reading (48 hrs.) courses. Grammar and vocabulary 
are mainly studied at first year level and are extended to a higher 
level incorporated into other skills. For their professional preparation, 
the students take one general (48 hrs.) and two subject specific 
methodology (96 hrs.) courses. By offering these courses, the English 
department expects to have proficient and competent graduates in 
English. The department’s expectations are described in the 
department objectives and in the graduate profile included in the 
1999 College catalogue. Two of the points embodied in the graduate 
profile of the English language trainees are: 
 

 Graduates will be proficient in listening, speaking, reading, and 
writing; and 

 

 Graduates will be equipped with the knowledge of various 
language teaching methods, approaches, and techniques to apply 
them in their classrooms effectively and flexibly. 

 

In short, the courses are believed to equip the trainees with linguistic 
knowledge and skills, and to enable them to share their knowledge, 
skills, and experiences as teachers. 
 

The students are required to practice teaching for three weeks in the 
year of their graduation after they have passed the prerequisite 
methodology courses. The systems for evaluating their achievement 
and effective practice are semester examinations and classroom 
teaching supervision respectively. 
 

This study sought to explore the competency beliefs, confidence in 
teaching, and teaching practice performances of prospective English 
major graduates of July 2000 at BDU. It attempted to respond to the 
following research questions. 
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Research Questions 
 

 Concurrent with the departmental output expectations of 
proficient and adequately prepared teachers, do the 
trainees feel competent with the awareness created in 
language skills and methodology? 

 

 Do they feel comfortable to teach in the high schools in the 
teaching practice programme? 

 

 Do their teaching performances in the teaching practice 
match with their competency beliefs and teaching 
confidence? 

 

Rationale 
 

The aim of teacher education is to prepare trainees to become 
effective teachers by providing them with the necessary subject-
matter (content) and pedagogical knowledge and skills (Schön, 
1983). Effectiveness of trainee preparation may be evaluated by 
evaluators, teachers, and/or educational authorities. This sort of 
evaluation, however, has been criticized by many scholars such as 
Williams and Burden (1997) as ‘outward’ or ‘external’. The most 
important thing that has been considered as an addition (or as an 
alternative by some people) to the external factor is the 
understanding of teachers’ thinking or beliefs.  
 

Thus far, trainees’ beliefs regarding what and how to teach have 
been widely studied (Gow and Kember, 1993 as cited by Williams 
and Burden, 1997). However, studies about trainees’ beliefs about 
themselves (their beliefs about their content and pedagogical 
knowledge) and their teaching confidence are relatively limited. This 
study, therefore, wanted to explore the beliefs of English language 
trainees at BDU about their linguistic capacity and pedagogical 
knowledge. It also wanted to investigate their confidence in teaching 
in the teaching practice.  
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A couple of reasons encouraged the researcher to study these 
issues. First, the English department at BDU evaluates the 
proficiency or competence of its trainees predominantly through 
examinations and supervision. This kind of evaluation may provide 
only a partial indication of the achievement and confidence of the 
trainees as well as programme effectiveness. Hence, studying the 
competency beliefs and the teaching confidence of the trainees would 
also be worth considering.  Second, so far only little or none is known 
about the English language trainees’ competency beliefs and/ or 
teaching confidence at BDU. So, there seems to be a felt need to 
investigate these issues. 
 

The result of the study can be useful for the students to assess where 
they stand; for the courses developers, to revise course objectives 
and content; and for English language instructors, to work towards 
satisfying trainees’ needs; i.e. to plug into the lacks of students. 

 

Literature Review 
 

Expected outcomes from teacher education  
 

Different writers  (e.g. Kessler, 1992; Schön, 1983) expounded the 
need for professional knowledge in teacher education. Schön (1983) 
categorized professional knowledge under received and experienced 
knowledge, while Ellis (1986) classified it as awareness-raising and 
experiential. The received (awareness-raising) knowledge constituted 
subject-matter knowledge (the necessary intellectual content), the 
underlying teaching principles and practical techniques. The 
experienced (experiential) knowledge, on the other hand, refers to 
that secured in actual teaching (Wallace, 1991; Reynolds, 1992).  
As in general education, in language teacher education also 
knowledge in the two areas stated above is required. It is true that in 
order to have an effective English teacher, training is essential. And 
the training involves strong theoretical preparation and practice. The 
theoretical preparation includes structured professional education in 
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linguistic mastery, training in skills proficiency and acquisition of the 
enabling skills (methods, approaches, and techniques) of teaching. 
Concerning the preparation, Brown (1990:87) said that the teacher in 
the course of training should acquire knowledge of the what, how, 
and why of teaching a language. These three domains refer to 
knowledge of the language (subject-matter) and methodology. Berry 
(1990:99) also explicated the importance of high language proficiency 
particularly for non-native language teachers as: the language level of 
non-native teachers is important in determining the extent to which 
the teacher uses the target language in the classroom and whether 
this will provide reliable input for learners. He noted that high 
language proficiency increases teacher confidence, facilitates the use 
of the target language in the classroom, and widens the choice of 
methodology. Wallace (1991:15) described the skilled language 
teacher as one who will be able to speak the target language to a 
reasonable degree of fluency, to organize pair and group work, to 
read a simple phonetic transcription, to be familiar with certain 
grammatical terms and so on. 
 

Whereas Brown (1990), Berry (1990), and Wallace (1991) stressed 
on the need for linguistic knowledge, skills, and proficiency of 
language teachers, Freeman and Richards (1996) considered the 
pedagogical factor as decisive in carrying out teaching practice 
successfully and activities related to confidence development. The 
pedagogical knowledge can help the trainees to carry out similar 
instruction during teaching practice, i.e. as may be expected by their 
trainers. Freeman and Richards (1996) wrote that teachers, however, 
were observed evading the methods introduced in campus courses 
so as to use other alternatives in their actual teaching environment.  
In summary, the expected outcomes from teacher education, 
particularly from language teacher education, are the trainees’ 
linguistic and pedagogic competence. Competence in both is vital to 
carry out language teaching in the short-term teaching practice 
university requirement and beyond in the life-long teaching career. 
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Teachers’ beliefs 
 

With the advent of cognitive psychology, the research emphasis on 
teaching and learning has shifted from  process-product observations 
to a focus on teachers’ thinking, beliefs, planning and decision-
making processes ( Fang, 1996 ). This shift of emphasis towards 
teachers’ perceptions might be because, on one hand, knowledge is 
understood as the development of beliefs and attitudes (Deford, 
1985; Blanton and Moorman, 1987). On the other, many of the 
characteristics, such as being concerned, active, respected, efficient, 
etc. (Ericksen, 1984), assumed as qualities of an effective teacher by 
many scholars, were criticized as ‘outward’ characteristics. Hence, 
‘inward’ characteristics such as teacher beliefs and thinking were 
given attention. It is believed that teachers’ actions are highly 
influenced by their beliefs, even more than they are determined by 
their knowledge (Williams and Burden, 1997). Studying the beliefs of 
the trainees about their academic capabilities, therefore, will be 
crucial. Pajares (1996:2) wrote that beliefs help the trainees 
determine what they do with the knowledge and skills they possess. 
He added, people engage in tasks in which they feel competent and 
confident and avoid those in which they do not. The effort people 
exert to accomplish tasks, and their perseverance will be influenced 
by their beliefs. Hence, the trainees’ competency beliefs and their 
confidence in teaching can influence their classroom teaching in the 
teaching practice. 
 

Teachers’ past experience as learners is considered as the principal 
source of beliefs. Change of conceptions due to new orientations is 
assumed to be taxing and potentially threatening for teachers (Florio-
Ruane and Lensmire, 1990; Richards and Lockhart, 1994; Williams 
and Burden, 1997). Other sources of beliefs can be teachers’ 
assumptions of the best method(s), their established practice, their 
accepted principles from approaches and methods, and other 
personality factors (Richards and Lockhart, 1994 ).  
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Teachers’ beliefs can be seen in two perspectives. The first is the 
belief about what and how to teach.  The second, however, is 
teachers’ beliefs about themselves. Both contribute to teachers’ 
confidence in teaching. 
 

 Teachers’ beliefs about teaching and learning 
 

Teachers’ belief about teaching and learning constitutes the ‘culture 
of teaching’ which refers both to the content and the process of 
teaching. Such a belief determines teachers’ instructional actions. 
 

Teachers’ belief systems are founded on the goals, values, 
and beliefs teachers hold in relation to the content and 
process of teaching, and their understanding of the systems 
in which they work and their roles within it. These beliefs 
and values serve as the background to much of the 
teachers’ decision making and action, and hence constitute 
what has been termed the ‘culture of teaching’ (Richards 
and Lockhart, 1994:30). 

 
This role of belief is also reflected in Williams and Burden (1997) as 
teachers’ deep-rooted beliefs about how languages are learned will 
pervade their classroom actions. Beliefs are considered to be more 
influential than the methodology teachers are told to adopt. 
  

A common dimension of teachers’ belief of English Language 
Teaching (ELT) teacher education is linear that involves the imparting 
of skills or competencies. The trainees are expected to come out and 
behave the same in certain ways. The linear approach may result in a 
change of behavior, but not necessarily a commitment or a belief 
(Williams, 1994). The other dimension which has received a 
tremendous support recently is the process and methodology of 
training and how teachers learn and develop. 
 

Recently attention has shifted from consideration of the 
content of teacher training, what to teach teachers, to the 
process and methodology of training and how teachers 
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learn.... Concern therefore...focuses on how teachers learn 
or develop (Williams, 1994:215). 

  

 Teachers’ beliefs about themselves 
 
To be effective, teachers need to convey a sense of self-confidence 
and develop self-esteem. Developing confidence and self-esteem 
helps teachers provide a supportive learning environment (Pine and 
Boy, 1977). To the contrary, lack of confidence in skills they  possess 
leads them to evade the teaching task, or their attempts will vanish in 
time of difficulty (Pajares, 1996). Studies on pre-service teachers’ 
beliefs about themselves revealed that most of them possessed an 
unrealistic optimism, and a self-serving bias (Florio-Ruane and 
Lensmire, 1990). Florio-Ruane and Lensmire reported that these 
teachers perceived they would be successful in teaching and 
predicted they would excel their peers. They overvalued affective 
variables and undervalued cognitive (academic) variables.  Bandura 
(1995) also indicated that pre-service teachers had such beliefs. He 
wrote that their sense of teacher efficacy was related to their beliefs 
about controlling students. Many of them tended to hold a pessimistic 
view of students’ motivation, and emphasized rigid control of 
classroom behavior. Such teachers relied on extrinsic inducements 
and negative sanctions to get students to study. 
 

Research showed that pre-service teachers were endowed with prior 
beliefs, and orientations to new approaches and methods of teaching 
were taxing and rather threatening. For example, Goodman (1988) 
found that pre-service teachers’ educational philosophy was rooted 
on their earlier experiences as pupils. These early experiences in 
developing educational beliefs may influence the pre-service teachers 
to become ‘resistant-to-change’. 
 
In short, pre-service teachers’ beliefs about teaching and learning as 
well as about themselves are based on their early experiences. In 
fact, it is asserted that language teacher education strives a lot to 
build pre-service teachers’ teaching confidence and their belief in 
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their own ability (Williams, 1994). A better understanding of pre-
service teachers’ perceptions (beliefs) of the practicum is assumed to 
provide language teacher education an opportunity to better 
understand how language teachers learn to teach. Recent researches 
suggest that the realities of the classroom rarely conform to pre-
service teachers’ expectations or images (Kagan, 1992; Johnson, 
1996). A language teacher preparation program, therefore, is 
expected to provide trainees with a theoretical view of teaching as 
well as a recognition of the classroom reality. 

 
Operational Definitions 

 
Competency beliefs =  trainees’ beliefs about their knowledge 

and ability in English language as well 
as knowledge in methodology.  

 

Teaching confidence =  trainees’ feelings to carry out teaching 
(particularly in the teaching practice). 

  
Pre-service teachers =  trainees; student-teachers; would-be 

graduates; graduating class English major 
students. 
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Methodology 
 

Participants and data sources 
 

All the 24 prospective graduates of the English department at Bahir 
Dar University (who would graduate in July 2000) participated in this 
study. Of these, five students did not respond to one or two items in 
any one of the questionnaires. So, they were excluded from the 
study. The data were gathered using multiple instruments: 
questionnaires, interviews and documents analyses. 
 

Procedure  
 

Pre-and post-teaching practice explorations were made. Before the 
three weeks teaching practice period, three types of questionnaires 
each of which constituted 10 closed items were distributed. The items 
in the questionnaires were adapted from Gibson and Dembo’s (1984) 
Teacher Efficacy Scale (for competency beliefs) and Woolfolk and 
Hoy’s (1990) Teacher Confidence (for confidence in teaching). Two of 
the questionnaires focused on the trainees’ espoused competency 
beliefs in linguistic ability and professional knowledge, and were 
distributed a month before the teaching practice period. The third type 
required information about their teaching confidence and was 
distributed and returned two days before the teaching practice period. 
This period was opted because it was considered as a reasonable 
time to obtain information about trainees’ teaching confidence in 
teaching practice.  
 

Each of the questionnaires constituted a five-point rating scale that 
ranged from strongly agree to strongly disagree. The scales were 
given 5 to 1 values respectively. The questions in the first type of 
questionnaire asked the students about their competency beliefs in 
the four language skills including vocabulary knowledge and 
grammar. The second type required them to rate their competency 
beliefs in the professional knowledge (methodology) they secured in 
teaching the four language skills, vocabulary and grammar. The third 
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type, however, required them to rate their confidence level to teach 
the four skills, vocabulary and grammar in the teaching practice 
period. 
 

The data gathered using the questionnaires were assumed to 
indicate the trainees’ espoused (expressed) competency beliefs and 
teaching confidence. In order to investigate their actual performance, 
however, their teaching practice results were gathered from the 
teaching practice coordinator. Furthermore, they were interviewed 
about how they found their teaching expectations against the 
classroom reality. The interview was conducted to find out their views 
based on the classroom reality. In addition, six English language 
instructors, who were trainees’ supervisors in teaching practice, were 
interviewed about what they had expected from their practising 
students (trainees) and what they really had observed during 
supervision. Information about the supervisors’ expectations versus 
the classroom realities was sought to secure supportive evidence and 
to reinforce the findings. The teaching practice assessment check-list 
(which is currently used as a yardstick) of the English department was 
also analyzed to see the instructors’ focus in evaluating the pre-
service teachers’ teaching practice performances. 
 

Method of analysis 
 

The data obtained about the students’ competency beliefs in linguistic 
ability and professional knowledge, their teaching confidence as well 
as their teaching practice results were statistically computed. The 
mean value and standard deviation of each of the above variables 
were computed to provide descriptive analysis. To determine the 
mean value and the standard deviation, the questionnaires’ results 
were converted to 100. This was done to make the comparisons 
between the teaching practice results and the other variables easy. 
 

In addition, Pearson’s Correlation Coefficient was used to assess to 
what extent each of the variables had relations and a predictive value 
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to one another. The post-teaching interviews and the teaching 
practice assessment checklist, however, were qualitatively analyzed. 
 

Findings 
 

Statistical findings 
 

Table 1: Mean Value and Standard deviation of the Competency 

Beliefs, Teaching Confidence and Teaching Practice Results 
 

 Linguistic 
competency 

beliefs 

Professional 
competency 

beliefs 

Confidence in 
teaching 

Teaching  
practice 
results 

 
Mean 

 
71.58 

 
77.68 

 
75.47 

 
65.58 

 
SD 

 
12.09 

 
14.84 

 
9,20 

 
6.58 

 
Put in descending order, each of the variables had the following 
mean: professional competency beliefs, 77.68; confidence in 
teaching, 75.47; linguistic competency beliefs, 71.58; and teaching 
practice results, 65.58. The highest deviation from the mean was 
observed in the trainees’ professional competency beliefs (14.84), 
and the least from teaching practice results (6.58). 
 

The correlations among the trainees’ linguistic and professional 
competency beliefs, their teaching confidence and their teaching 
practice results were computed. The results are shown in Table 2. 
 

As indicated in Table 2, the correlation between trainees’ linguistic 
and professional competency beliefs was 0.67. The correlations 
between their linguistic competency beliefs and their teaching 
confidence, as well   as their teaching practice results were 0.01 and  
-0.24 respectively. The correlations between their professional 
competency beliefs and their teaching confidence, as well as their 
teaching practice results were -0.12 and -0.01. When their teaching 
confidence and teaching performance results were compared, they 
showed only -0.08 relationships. 
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Table 2: Correlations Among Competency Beliefs, Teaching 

Confidence and Teaching Practice Results 
 

 Professional 
competency 
beliefs 

 
Confidence in 
teaching  

 
Teaching  
practice results 

Linguistic 
competency 
beliefs 

 
 
0.67 (3.72)* 

 
 
0.01 (0.04)** 

 
 
-0.24 (-1.02)** 

 

Professional 
competency 
beliefs 

  

 
 
-0.12 (-0.50)** 

 
 
 
 

-0.01 (-0.04)** 
 

Confidence in 
teaching  

   

 
-0.08  (-0.33)** 

*indicates result of the significance level df.=17;  tcit.=1.74 ; p<0.05 

**indicates results of the significance level df.=17;  tcrit.=1.74 ; p>0.05 

 

The significance level of each of these results was also computed. 
Only trainees’ competency beliefs in linguistic and professional 
knowledge indicated significant relations; that is, t-obs. > t-crit. 
(df.=17; 3.72>1.74; p<0.05). Non-significant inverse relations were 
found between their linguistic competency beliefs and teaching 
practice results (-1.02); between their professional competency 
beliefs and their confidence in teaching (-0.50); between their 
professional  competency  beliefs  and  their  teaching practice results 
(-0.04); as well as between their confidence in teaching and teaching 
practice results (-0.33). Another non-significant relationship was 
found between their linguistic competency beliefs and teaching 
confidence (0.04). 
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Analysis of the teaching practice assessment check-list 
 

The focus of the English department ‘Teaching Practice Check-list’ 
was analyzed. The checklist contained seven sections. Each of the 
sections was meant to assess different student-teacher activities. The 
sections assessed trainees’ lesson planning and implementation, 
their use of gesture, language, classroom procedure and 
management, methodology, feedback, and other teacher activities. 
Totally, 35 items were included in the check-list. Although the items 
were divided into different sections, many of them were related to the 
assessment of methodology. From the total of 35 items, 28 (80%) 
referred to methodology, and 7 (20%) assessed the student-teacher’s 
language ability, subject-matter knowledge, way of explanation and 
content coverage. 
 

Instructors’ expectations versus classroom realities 
 

Six English language instructors at BDU who supervised and gave 
results to trainees were asked about their expectations of the 
trainees’ linguistic ability and methods application in the teaching 
practice. The instructors had slightly differing expectations and also 
differing observations of the trainees’ performances.  
 

Three of the instructors stated that they expected the trainees to be 
proficient in language and good at employing the methods they had 
studied. As reflected in their responses, their expectations were 
based on the span of time the trainees spent studying the language 
and the courses they took to develop their language and teaching 
skills.  
 

Instructor A 
 

The student-teachers, after a four-year study of English language, 
were expected to have a sound command of the language. They 
were especially expected to decrease, if not to avoid, the number of 
the gravest grammatical errors (both spoken and written) that their 
students may imitate and use.  
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Having been acquainted with the ‘modern  (up-to-date) methods’ of 
teaching, the trainees, I expected, are able at least to change the 
‘conventional methods’ of teaching and classroom situations to 
some extent in a way that the learners are encouraged to be 
involved in the teaching-learning process.    

Instructor B 
 

Having realized that the trainees had taken different types of skill 
courses such as reading skills, listening skills and spoken English 
courses, I expected that they would not have any linguistic problem. 

 

Since they had taken the two ELT methodology courses, the 
trainees, I expected, would have enough theoretical knowledge 
which may gradually improve through time as they had the 
opportunity to put the theories into practice. 

 

Instructor C 
 

I expected the students to be good at English and to have the 
appropriate skill in the use of classroom techniques. 

 

Based on their observations as supervisors in the teaching practice, 
instructors A and B evaluated the linguistic competence of most of 
the trainees as low.  Instructor C, however, said that nearly all the 
trainees he supervised had a reasonable communicative ability.  
 

Regarding the use of the ‘up-to-date’ methodology or classroom 
technique, instructors A and C said that it was unsatisfactory, while 
instructor B appreciated the endeavor. The instructors’ responded to 
the interview as follows: 
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Instructor A 
 
On the contrary, to one’s surprise, most of the student-teachers I 
observed were found committing errors that made the meaning of 
their talk or writing obscure or distorted. 

 
Most of the trainees I observed were found to use nearly the same 
kinds of techniques and classroom organization as that of the 
regular teachers. By and large, I couldn’t see any sign of transition 
or shift introduced by the trainees from ‘the traditional’ way of 
teaching the language. 

 

Instructor B 
 

Actually I found some of them competent. However, most of them 
did not seem to be language teachers because of their poor 
command of the language. 
 

I appreciate their sticking to the new ELT methodology principles 
during their practice. They tried to teach those different skills as they 
were taught how to teach them. 

 

Instructor C 
 

Nearly all (but one) had a reasonable communicative ability. I found 
them as expected. ... As for the students’ mastery of the subject 
matter, it appears they are good at it. 
 

Regarding methodology, I observed inappropriate exploitation of the 
techniques they acquired in class. For example, in a reading lesson 
that was designed to promote their scanning ability, students were 
asked to identify those words that should be capitalized. In this 
regard, it is worth mentioning about the undemocratic nature of the 
class. The lessons were dominated by teacher talk. The students 
were limited to receiving what the teacher had to say.  

 

Two other instructors said that they did not expect much from the 
trainees because of the very limited opportunity of practising time, 
lack of prior teaching experience, and  psychological factors such as 



The Ethiopian Journal of Education Vol. XXII No. 1 June 2002 

 

101 

anxiety, lack of confidence, and the feeling ( fear ) that a supervisor 
was there to evaluate and offer a grade. 
 

Instructor D 
 

Before I went out for the evaluation of the teaching practice, I had 
the expectation that the student- teachers would ‘struggle’ to go 
away from the traditional way of teaching. 

 
Instructor E 
 

 I haven’t had much expectation due to the short time set up. 

  
These instructors evaluated the language ability and the methods 
application of the student-teachers as average. 

 
Instructor D 
 

They were almost successful in applying what they learned in 
class.... In short, there were factors which affected students’ 
performance; most of the student-teachers were almost successful. 

 
Instructor E 

 

The way they attempted to handle grammatical items and the way 
they used communicative repertoire to convey their meanings were 
found fairly good. They were also competent in the way they planned 
and implemented their lesson plans. 

 
One of the instructors who responded to the interview did not 
explicitly put what his expectations were. However, he listed the 
negative and the positive behaviors he had observed among the 
student-teachers. He indicated that the trainees had good preparation 
and presentation of lessons, but lacked language accuracy and 
confidence in teaching. 
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Instructor F 
 

Their negative teaching behavior was in language (spelling, 
pronunciation, language of explanation). Other problems observed 
included being unable to give clear instruction at the stages of the 
lesson, and lack of confidence. On the other hand, their positive 
teaching behaviors were preparing lesson plan according to the 
nature of the lesson, treating students’ errors in an unthreatening 
way, preparing additional text so as to fit the presentation of the 
lesson, showing cooperative-type of teaching and giving exercises. 

 
Student-teachers’ expectations versus realities 
  
Nearly all the 10 (42%) interviewed student-teachers had the 
expectations that the teaching practice would not be difficult for them. 
They expected that they would practice the communicative 
methodology (which was the main focus of the English language 
methodology taught courses) without any problem, and expected 
success. 
 

For the majority of these student-teachers, however, the classroom 
situation was not found as expected. For example, two students 
expressed the classroom realities as follows: 
 

Student A 
 

But, after I went and met the students the practical situation in the 
classroom was quite different from my expectation. From my 
observation the teacher’s way of teaching was by far different from 
what we learnt in theory. 

 

Student B 
  

I was not in a position to practice what I intended. 
  

As reported, the major problems of the trainees were lack of 
experience, poor classroom management, unwillingness of high 
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school students to accept group tasks, lack of student discipline, and 
the presence of a supervisor in a class. 
 

Discussion 

 
The descriptive statistics on the trainees’ competency beliefs and 
teaching confidence showed that they perceived their professional 
preparation as high. Their teaching practice results were relatively 
low.  
 
The correlation statistics about the trainees’ competency beliefs in 
their linguistic ability and professional knowledge revealed a strong 
positive relationship. The pre-service teachers believed that they 
were proficient in language skills and were equipped with adequate 
theoretical background. Their belief matched with the English 
department’s expected outcomes indicated in the department 
objectives. The department expected the trainees to be proficient in 
linguistic skills and to be able to share their knowledge, skills, and 
experiences to their students. The trainees’ claim also matched with 
Florio-Ruane and Lensmire’s (1990) findings on pre-service teachers’ 
perceptions concerning their competence. According to these 
researchers, most pre-service teachers perceived they would be 
successful in teaching, but perception of this kind was considered as 
an ‘unrealistic optimism’. The trainees’ sense of linguistic and 
methods competence might have emanated from the theoretical 
doses they took, the duration of their study, and their success in the 
theory-based examinations. 
 
The main purpose of offering linguistic and methodology courses is to 
prepare trainees to become good practitioners. The acquired 
knowledge and skills in both need to have a positive relationship with 
teaching. Although these trainees believed that they achieved a good 
deal of theoretical knowledge of methodology and a considerable 
linguistic competence, it was found that it hardly contributed to 
confidence building in their teaching. This result did not go in 
accordance with what researchers indicated. As stated in the 



Abiy Yigzaw 104 

literature, high linguistic and professional competency beliefs 
increase teacher confidence and facilitate the use of the target 
language in the classroom (Almarza, 1996). However, as depicted in 
Table 2, this study indicated that there was almost no relationship. 
This can be attributed to the trainees’ inadequate exposure to 
practical applications of the theoretical knowledge they gained. 
 
A similar result was found out in the relations between the trainees’ 
linguistic and professional competency beliefs and their teaching 
practice results. The teaching practice results indicated a non-
significant negative relation with the trainees’ linguistic competency 
beliefs. And, a non-significant negative correlation was also found out 
between the trainees’ professional competency beliefs and their 
teaching practice results. A language teacher needs to have a good 
language command, a skill of proper application of methods, and a 
sense of self-confidence (Pine and Boy, 1977). But, trainees’ claim of 
competence has been amazingly unrelated to their confidence in 
teaching and their teaching practice results. One of the possible 
causes for this can be that the pre-service teachers were 
unrealistically optimistic when they expressed about their competence 
in the two areas. Many teachers feel that they are proficient in 
language skills and have a sense of mastery of methods, which 
usually mismatches with actual classroom practices. The other, and 
probably the main, could be that the trainees did not have adequate 
micro, peer and/or macro teaching practices. 
 
In addition to the statistical findings, data were gathered by way of 
descriptive self-report. In this regard, both the instructors 
(supervisors) and the pre-service teachers were required to describe 
their expectations versus the classroom realities. The instructors’ 
reports focused on their expectations about the pre-service teachers’ 
linguistic ability and the methods they used while teaching, and how 
they found these in the practical (classroom) situation. Nearly all the 
instructors expected the pre-service teachers to be good at English. 
Besides, they thought that the pre-service teachers would employ the 
methods and teaching techniques they studied while teaching. The 
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supervisors’ expectations were in accordance with the English 
department’s teaching practice checklist, which emphasized 
evaluating the trainees’ language ability and appropriate use of 
methods. Their reports, however, unraveled that many of the pre-
service teachers possessed low linguistic competence. Quite the 
majority of these trainees also lacked the desired teaching 
competence. 
 
The pre-service teachers also reported that their teaching practice did 
not go in line with their expectations. They expected that they would 
apply the methodology they were taught to adopt. This initial teaching 
experience in the practicum, however, did not match their images. 
This goes in concert with other studies. Johnson (1996), for instance, 
stated that the realities of the classroom rarely conform to pre-service 
teachers’ expectations or images. She described such a discrepancy 
as the gap between …vision and the reality of teaching. The trainees 
ascribed the occurrence of the gap to student discipline, 
management-related situations and the presence of a supervisor to 
evaluate. This could imply, if these trainees had had the exposure to 
real classroom situations in the form of practice, the gap between 
their vision (expectations) and the classroom reality could have been 
narrowed. 

 

Conclusion and Recommendations 
 

Results from the descriptive statistics indicated that the trainees had 
high perception about their teaching capacity and professional 
preparation. Their teaching practice results, however, were relatively 
low. Although it can be argued that this indication alone may not imply 
that their teaching capacity was low ( for an average of 65.58 may be 
considered satisfactory University score ), the correlation results and 
the teacher and student interviews, as complementary methods of 
investigation, also revealed that the trainees had problems in the 
practicum. 
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The statistics on correlation indicated a significant relation only 
between the linguistic and the professional competency beliefs. Non-
significant relations were observed among other variables. The 
responses to the teacher interview showed that many of the 
supervisors found their students in the practicum incompetent both in 
language ability and methods use. For the post-practicum interview, 
the students’ responses indicated that they also found their 
classroom experiences were not up to their expectations. Thus, it 
may be concluded that the trainees’ study focus was rather academic 
or theoretical knowledge; that is, practical activities and practical 
proficiency (competence) evaluations were not practiced or were only 
minimally practised. 
 
Based on the conclusion, then, the following recommendations could 
be made. 
 

 In order to alleviate the problem seen in the practicum, in addition 
to the three weeks practice, more practice time as peer and micro-
teaching should be organized in the course of training. Such 
practice may help the trainees to develop their teaching 
competence and teaching confidence; 

 

 Methodology courses should be designed to integrate awareness 
and practice in a balanced manner. This may provide trainees with 
competence in professional ability; and 

 

 The English department, should offer additional skill courses to 
help the would-be teachers enhance their language capacity. 
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